

**TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION  
PURCHASING AGENDA – JUNE 26, 2019**

**2018/2019 SCHOOL YEAR**

**C. AWARD OF BIDS**

**BID: SITE-166 FLOORING REPLACEMENT & ASSOCIATED WORK @ HIGH SCHOOL EAST, INTERMEDIATE SCHOOL NORTH AND SILVER BAY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL (REFERENDUM PROJECT)**

	<b>George Koustas Painting &amp; Construction, LLC (*)</b>
<b>Option 1 with PLA</b>	
1. High School East	No Bid
2. Intermediate North	No Bid
3A. Silver Bay	No Bid
3B - I. Silver Bay	No Bid
3B - II. Silver Bay	No Bid
3C. Silver Bay	No Bid
3D. Silver Bay	No Bid
3E - I. Silver Bay	No Bid
3E - II. Silver Bay	No Bid
3F. Silver Bay	No Bid
3G. Silver Bay	No Bid
3H - I. Silver Bay	No Bid
3H - II. Silver Bay	No Bid
3I. Silver Bay	No Bid
3J. Silver Bay	No Bid
<b>Option 2 without PLA</b>	
4. High School East	\$199,000.00 (*)
5. Intermediate North	\$139,000.00 (*)
6A. Silver Bay	No Bid
6B - I. Silver Bay	No Bid
6B - II. Silver Bay	No Bid
6C. Silver Bay	No Bid
6D. Silver Bay	No Bid
6E - I. Silver Bay	No Bid
6E - II. Silver Bay	No Bid
6F. Silver Bay	No Bid
6G. Silver Bay	No Bid
6H - I. Silver Bay	No Bid
6H - II. Silver Bay	No Bid
6I. Silver Bay	No Bid
6J. Silver Bay	No Bid
<b>(*) TOTAL AWARD</b>	<b>\$338,000.00</b>

**TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION  
PURCHASING AGENDA – JUNE 26, 2019**

**2018/2019 SCHOOL YEAR**

**C. AWARD OF BIDS**

**BID: SITE-171 REMOVAL & REPLACEMENT OF EXISTING LOCKERS & ASSOCIATED WORK AT TOMS RIVER HIGH SCHOOL NORTH & TOMS RIVER HIGH SCHOOL SOUTH (REFERENDUM PROJECT)**

<b>Option 1 with PLA</b>		
<b>HIGH SCHOOL NORTH</b>	<b>Hertz Furniture</b>	<b>Nickerson Corporation</b>
1a. F-Wing 1st & 2nd Floors	No Bid	\$153,089.00
1b. BB-Wing	No Bid	\$46,975.00
1c. E-Wing	No Bid	\$54,734.00
1d. A-Wing 1st Floor	No Bid	\$26,843.00
2. ALT-1 B-Wing 1st Floor	No Bid	\$64,381.00
2. ALT-1 B-Wing 2nd Floor	No Bid	\$56,686.00
2. ALT-2 C-Wing 1st Floor	No Bid	\$66,058.00
2. ALT-2 C-Wing 2nd Floor	No Bid	\$57,460.00
2. ALT-3 D-Wing	No Bid	\$94,369.00
2. ALT-4 A-Wing 2nd Floor	No Bid	\$50,120.00
2. ALT-5 A-Wing 1st Floor	No Bid	\$26,843.00
2. ALT-6 A-Wing 1st Floor	No Bid	\$26,843.00
<b>HIGH SCHOOL SOUTH</b>	<b>Hertz Furniture</b>	<b>Nickerson Corporation</b>
1a. B-Wing	No Bid	\$61,097.00
1b. D-Wing 1st Floor	No Bid	\$66,746.00
1b. D-Wing 2nd Floor	No Bid	\$51,980.00
1c. A-Wing	No Bid	\$48,752.00
2. ALT-1 F-Wing	No Bid	\$30,967.00
2. ALT-2 F-Wing	No Bid	\$32,067.00
2. ALT-3 F-Wing	No Bid	\$34,267.00
2. ALT-4 E-Wing	No Bid	\$9,415.00
2. ALT-5 C-Wing	No Bid	\$52,518.00

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE

**TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION  
PURCHASING AGENDA – JUNE 26, 2019**

**2018/2019 SCHOOL YEAR**

**C. AWARD OF BIDS**

**BID: SITE-171 REMOVAL & REPLACEMENT OF EXISTING LOCKERS & ASSOCIATED WORK AT TOMS RIVER HIGH SCHOOL NORTH & TOMS RIVER HIGH SCHOOL SOUTH (REFERENDUM PROJECT) - CONTINUED**

<b>Option 2 without PLA</b>			
<b>HIGH SCHOOL NORTH</b>	<b>Hertz Furniture</b>	<b>Nickerson Corporation (*)</b>	
3e. F-Wing 1st & 2nd Floors (*)	\$131,307.46	\$140,583.00	(*)
3f. BB-Wing (*)	\$39,153.07	\$43,137.00	(*)
3g. E-Wing (*)	\$72,978.42	\$50,263.00	(*)
3h. A-Wing 1st Floor (*)	\$36,906.06	\$24,650.00	(*)
4. ALT-1 B-Wing 1st Floor	\$138,726.49	\$59,121.00	
4. ALT-1 B-Wing 2nd Floor	\$122,498.57	\$49,300.00	
4. ALT-2 C-Wing 1st Floor	\$145,545.31	\$60,662.00	
4. ALT-2 C-Wing 2nd Floor	\$130,943.46	\$52,766.00	
4. ALT-3 D-Wing	\$616,455.50	\$86,660.00	
4. ALT-4 A-Wing 2nd Floor	\$91,507.44	\$46,026.00	
4. ALT-5 A-Wing 1st Floor	\$34,855.91	\$24,650.00	
4. ALT-6 A-Wing 1st Floor	\$32,013.73	\$24,650.00	
<b>HIGH SCHOOL SOUTH</b>	<b>Hertz Furniture</b>	<b>Nickerson Corporation (*)</b>	
3d. B-Wing (*)	\$81,238.72	\$56,095.00	(*)
3e. D-Wing 1st Floor (*)	\$90,027.42	\$61,281.00	(*)
3e. D-Wing 2nd Floor (*)	\$73,599.46	\$47,642.00	(*)
3f. A-Wing (*)	\$64,915.21	\$44,760.00	(*)
4. ALT-1 F-Wing	\$43,077.46	\$28,431.00	
4. ALT-2 F-Wing	\$44,214.44	\$29,531.00	
4. ALT-3 F-Wing (*)	\$47,358.61	\$31,731.00	(*)
4. ALT-4 E-Wing (*)	\$13,067.56	\$8,644.00	(*)
4. ALT-5 C-Wing	\$88,261.12	\$48,219.00	

(\*) AWARD: HIGH SCHOOL NORTH \$258,633.00

(\*) AWARD: HIGH SCHOOL SOUTH \$250,153.00