TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA - MAY 18, 2022

C. AWARD OF BIDS
LEASE-37 LEASING OF PREMISES (202)

BIDDER: T & M ASSOCIATES (*)

2021/2022 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

MONTHLY BASE RENT
RENEWAL | DATES MONTHLY RENT TOTAL
MONTHS
1-12 06/01/2022 — 05/31/2023 $15,052.08 $180,624.96
13-24 06/01/2023 - 05/31/2024 $15,052.08 $180,624.96
25-36 06/01/2024 — 05/31/2025 $15.654.16 $187,849.92
37-48 06/01/2025 — 05/31/2026 $16,280.32 $195,363.84
49-60 06/01/2026 — 05/31/2027 $16,931.54 $203,178.48
LEASE TERM BASE RENT TOTAL.: $947,642.16
(*) AWARD
E. STUDENT TRANSPORTATION
1. AWARD OF BIDS
BID: TRANS-176S
BID/ ROUTE RT. TYPE/ CONTRACT VEH TOTAL | NO. [ MILEAGE TOTAL
QUOTE | #/DESTINATION | # STUDENTS VENDOR PERIOD RT S AIDE COST | DAYS +- CONTRACTS | AWARD
7/1/21-6/30/22
2254S ALPHA (PRO-RATED
BID _| SCHOOL (1) SPED A&M TRANS LLC FOR RSY) $800.00 | $100.00 | $900.00 | 180 $1.50 $162,000.00
D.A.G. TRANSPORT $469.00 | $75.00 | $54400 | 180 $1.50 $97,920.00 )
GARAS TRANS LLC $596.00 | $100.00 | $696.00 | 180 $1.50 $125,280.00
JONAH
TRANSPORTATION $550.00 | $87.00 | $637.00 | 180 $1.50 $114,660.00
(") AWARD. 4 BIDS RECEIVED.
ROUTE ADDENDUM #1
MILEAGE FINAL ADJUSTED
ROUTE SCHOOL VENDOR PER DIEM COST cosT PER DIEM RATE | EFFECTIVE DATE REASON
COASTAL LEARNING ADDED STUDENT TO
17028 CENTER R&D TRANSIT $157.55 524.00 $181.55 1020121 ROUTE.
ROUTE ADDENDUM #2
FINAL ADJUSTED
ROUTE SCHOOL VENDOR PER DIEM COST | MILEAGE COST | PER DIEM RATE | EFFECTIVE DATE REASON
COASTAL LEARNING ADDED STUDENT TO
17028 CENTER R&D TRANSIT $181.55 $6.60 $188.15 1249721 ROUTE.




TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA — MAY 18, 2022

C.

AWARD OF BIDS

BID: CAFE-01 MILK, JUICE & DAIRY REQUIREMENTS

2022/2023 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

PAGE 10OF 3
PART | EST QTY DESCRIPTION CLASS | PRICE JAN 2022 BALFORD FARMS () BALFORD FARMS (*)
MARGIN TOTAL
1 300,000 | LOW WHITE 1% - 1/2 PINT 0.09910 0.22490 97,200.00 PAPER
2 70,000 | FAT FREE STRAWBERRY 1/2 PINT 0.08230 0.24290 22,764.00 PAPER
3 500,000 | FAT FREE CHOCOLATE 1/2 PINT 0.08230 0.23290 157,600.00 PAPER
4 200 | LOT FAT WHITE 1% - 1/2 GALLON 0.79260 1.15380 389.28 PLASTIC
277,953.28
PART Il EST QTY DESCRIPTION BALFORD FARMS (“) BALFORD FARMS (1)
UNIT PRICE TOTAL
5 150 | HALF & HALF QUART 2.2922 343.83 PAPER
6 96 | HEAVY CREAM - QUART 5.6661 543.95 PAPER
7 48 | CREAMERS 3/8 OZ - CASE/348 11.0299 529.44 PLASTIC
8 100 | CREAMERS FR VAN PC - CASE/288 26.5410 2,654.10 PLASTIC
9 12 | ORANGE JUICE 15.2 OZ - CASE/24 CS NO BID 0.0000 0.00
10 300 | ORANGE JUICE 1/2 GALLON 2.8500 855.00 PLASTIC
11 1500 | CREAM CHEESE 3# PKG - CASE/MO NO BID 0.0000 0.00
12 18 | CREAM CHEESE PC - CASE/00 27.6400 497.52 PLASTIC
13 72 | COTTAGE CHEESE 5# 9.7030 698.62 PLASTIC
14 100 | RICOTTA CHEESE 3# 5.6800 568.00 PLASTIC
15 18 | SOUR CREAM PINT 2.5395 45.71 PLASTIC
6,736.16




TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA - MAY 18, 2022

C.

2022/2023 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

AWARD OF BIDS {CONTINUED)

BID: CAFE-01 MILK, JUICE & DAIRY REQUIREMENTS (CONTINUED)

PAGE 2 OF 3
PART lil EST QTY DESCRIPTION BALFORD FARMS (*) BALFORD FARMS (*)
UNIT PRICE TOTAL
16 1.000 | APPLE JUICE 4 OZ - CASES72 13.66560 13,665.60 PLASTIC
17 300 | FRUIT PUNCH 4 OZ - CASEIT2 14.03280 4,209.84 PLASTIC
18 150 | GRAPE JUICE 4 OZ - CASE/72 15.27840 2,291.76 PLASTIC
19 425 | ORANGE JUICE 4 OZ - CASE/72 15.14160 6.435.18 PLASTIC
20 450 | APPLE JUICE 6 OZ - CASE/70 NO BID 0.00000 0.00
21 400 | FRUIT PUNCH 6 OZ - CASE/7Q NO BID 0.00000 0.00
22 150 | GRAPE JUICE 6 OZ - CASE/70 NO BID 0.00000 0.00
23 300 | ORANGE JUICE 6 OZ - CASE/7D NO BID 0.00000 0.00
26,602.38
PART IV EST QTY DESCRIPTION BALFORD FARMS (*} BALFORD FARMS ()
UNIT PRICE TOTAL
24 200 | YOGURT - 4 OZ CS/24 NO BID 0.0000 0.00
25 600 | YOGURT FRUIT ON BOTTOM 8 OZ CS/12 NO BID 0.0000 0.00
26 600 | YOGURT LIGHT & FIT 8 OZ CS/12 NQ BID 0.0000 0.00
27 50 | YOGURT 6 OZ - PACK/4 NO BID 0.0000 0.00
28 200 | YOGURT 64 OZ 4# POUCH - CS/6 NO BID 0.0000 0.00
29 100 | YOGURT 3.1 OZ 6-PACK - CS/8 NO BID 0.0000 0.00
0.00
ESTIMATED TOTAL EXPENDITURE: 311,291.82




TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA — MAY 18, 2022

2022/2023 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

C. AWARD OF BIDS (CONTINUED)

BID: CAFE-01 MILK, JUICE & DAIRY REQUIREMENTS {CONTINUED)

PAGE 30F 3
BALFORD FARMS
PART V EST QTY DESCRIPTION )
UNIT PRICE
30 | UNKNOWN | CREAMER 3/8 OZ CS/348 11.0299 PLASTIC
31 | UNKNOWN | FR VAN CREAMER 1/2 OZ CS5/288 26.5410 PLASTIC
32 | UNKNOWN | CONT. BUTTER CHIPS 17# CASE 87.0400 FOIL
33 | UNKNOWN | PC CREAM CHEESE 1 OZ - CS/100 27.6400 PLASTIC
BALFORD FARMS
PART VI EST QTY DESCRIPTION )
UNIT PRICE
34 | UNKNOWN | LACTAID LACTOSE-FREE MILK 1/2 PINT 0.5451 PAPER

PLUS $9.95 PER ORDER PER DELIVERY LOCATION

(*) AWARD - UNIT PRICES TO HOLD FOR THE CONTRACT PERIOD JULY 1, 2022 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2023.

ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: $375,000.00
PURCHASING REQUESTS TO BE SUBMITTED FOR BOE APPROVAL ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.




TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA - MAY 18, 2022

2022/2023 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

c.2

REQUEST FOR PROFESSIONAL QUALIFICATIONS

PQ: THERAPISTS & CONSULTANTS

VENDOR FEE REQUESTED
ADVANCE EDUCATICN ADVISEMENT CORP. SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1
ALL CARE THERAPY SERVICES SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

AMN HEALTHCARE

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

BRETT DINOVI & ASSOCIATES

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

THE CHILDREN'S CENTER OF MONMOUTH CO.

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

DELTA-T GROUP NORTH JERSEY

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

EDU HEALTHCARE

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

GENERAL HEALTHCARE DBA GHR EDUCATION

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

GMB LEARNING CONSULTANTS

$65.00/HOUR

INVO HEALTHCARE SERVICES SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1
J & B THERAPY SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1
JUMP AHEAD PEDIATRICS SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

KALEDIOSCOPE EDUCATION SOLUTIONS

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

MBG THERAPY

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

OXFORD CONSULTING SERVICES, INC.

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

PREFERRED BEHAVIORAL GROUP

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

PROCARE THERAPY

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

THE STEPPING STONES GROUF

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

JCHORDS DBA THERAPYTRAVELERS

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

UNITED THERAPY SOLUTIONS

SEE ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT #1

YMCA OF GREATER MONMOUTH COUNTY

3,500.00 PER BUILDING FOR A FEE OF $63,000.00

QUALIFICATIONS ARE ACCEPTED FOR THE PERIOD JULY 1, 2022 - JUNE 30, 2023.
SERVICES WILL BE UTILIZED ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS ONLY.
PURCHASE REQUESTS WILL BE SUBMITTED FOR BOARD APPROVAL AS NEEDED.




TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA - MAY 18, 2022

2022/2023 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

c.2 REQUEST FOR PROFESSIONAL QUALIFICATIONS (CONTINUED)

PQ: THERAPISTS & CONSULTANTS — THERAPEUTIC MENTAL HEALTH SERVICES

VENDQOR SERVICES PROPOSED AND FEE REQUESTED
EFFECTIVE SCHOOL SOLUTIONS, LLC (*) ESTABLISHED PROGRAM AS REQUIRED. $435,000.00 FLAT FEE FOR THE PERIOD JULY 2022 THROUGH JUNE 2023,
INVO HEALTHCARE ASSOCIATES, LLC STAFF AND HOURS TO BE DETERMINED BASED ON PROGRAM TO BE DEVELOPED BY PROVIDER
HOURLY RATES PROPOSED: | LICENSED CLINICAL SOCIAL WORKER (LCSW) $67.00/HOUR
LICENSED MENTAL HEALTH WORKER (LMHC) $64.00/HOUR
LICENSED PROFESSIONAL COUNSELOR (LPC) $62.00/HOUR

(*) QUALIFICATIONS ACCEPTED FOR CONTRACT AWARD FOR THE PERIOD JULY 1, 2022 - JUNE 30, 2023.
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ADVANCE can provide services under the scope of this proposal at the following rates: '
Occupational Therapist $81.00/hour

Physical Therapist $85.00/hour

Speech Therapist $81.00/hour

School Social Warker $61.00/hour

School Psychologist 567.00/hour

Learning Disabilities Teacher Consultant  $67.00/hour

Evaluations (Speech, OT, Educational, Psych) $430.00/evaluation

Sacial History Evaluations $260/evaluation

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1



Ll Corees 78t i €T

#15. School-based day rate: $84 per hour; for direct and indirect occupational
therapy services (including but not limited to: treatments, telehealth,
consultations, screenings, evaluations/re-evaluations, IEP/504
documentation, IR&S, and meetings).

$325 for evaluation, which shall include therapists clinical assessment,
standardized testing procedures (if applicable), parent/teacher interview if
applicable, and written results.

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you require additional documentation.
Thank you,

John Panassidi
%/ L, 51727

Jeny—

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1
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AMN'

Healthcare
Pricing
ALL-INCLUSIVE FEE PROPQOSAL

Below are our suggested negotiable rates. Rates listed are all-inclusive regardiess of clinical activity
or location and are for the 2022-2023 school year. Rates for multi-year contracts will increase by the
most recent published Medical Care Services National CP! index or three percent (3%), whichever is
greater, every year the contract is renewed unless otherwise negotiated between AMN and your
district,

Occupational Therapist, Physical Therapist, Speech Language Pathologist |  $72-77 p/hr.*
School Social Worker | $72.77 p/hr.*
Bilingual OT, PT, SLP,  $77-82 p/hr.*
Bilingual SSW | $77-82 p/hr.*
Therapy Assistant (COTA, PTA, SLPA) $62-67 p/hr.*
Clinical Fellow {CF) $69-72p/hr.*
Teletherapist Upon Request
Bilingual Teletherapist Upon Request
* Rate dependent on providers’ experience

1. ALL-INCLUSIVE RATES: Your district can rely on us to provide cost effective services since we charge
a fiat hourly rate regardless of the clinical activity or location. This rate is fixed for the full duration
of each individual contract, and we never charge for holidays or forecasted days off. Our clinicians
onfy work pre-approved hours and days, resulting in no ynexpected cost overages for your district.

Examples of included clinical activities: Direct services, group sessions, individual sessions,
evaluations, assessments, meetings, scheduling, preparing reports, data entry, communication
(with parents, teachers, and district personnel), etc.

2. LONG-TERM COSTS, INVOICING, AND BILLING: We bill only for hours worked. Our all-inclusive rate

is billed per hour for services during school hours. Clients are sent weekly invoices via email as well
as monthly official statements. Payment can be remitted by ACH, check, or wire transfer.

3. MILEAGE: Mileage will only be charged when a clinician travels between locations in a single day.

District will be charged the IRS mileage rate, or as negotiated between your district and AMN.

4. COMPLIANCE EXPENSES: Compliance, credentialing, and on-boarding of travelers according to

Joint Commission regulations occurs fully at our expense.

AMN Allied Service, LLC 45
11001 W. 120th Ave , Ste. 310

Amamfiald ~A ANNY . ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1



Toms River Regional School District
July 1, 2022 - June 30, 2023 Fee Schedule

Clinical Associates: $55 per hour and at least 2.5 hours per week is required for preparation of materials at
the aforementioned full hourly rate, which may include preparation of data collection books, extensive report
writing {not progress notes), telephone meetings with employees, and strateglzing specific behavioral
contingencies for the client are all billed at the aforementioned full hourly rate. This clinician provides the
majority of the consultatlon,

The Clinical Associate level of direct support will have recelved training commensurate with that of the
Registered Behavlor Technitian (RBT), credentialed by the Behaviar Analysls Certification Board (BACB) or
be currently enrolied in a BACB Board Certification Program. Credentials listed here http://bach.com/rbt.

Behavior Consultant: Behavior Consultation will be provided at $126 per hour, and at least 2 hours per week
is required for preparation of materifals at the afarementioned full hourly rate, which may inciude preparation
of materials, such as data collection books, extensive report writing {not progress notes), telephone meetings

with families and employees, and strategizing spe encies for the client are all billed at
the aforementicned full hourly rate.

cle. Electronic involces are sent on 2 bl-weekly basis gratt Diov! & Associates
sts incurred to date. All payments should be mailed witkin 30 days to:
Brett DINavl & Assaclates, L.L.C,
P.O, Bax 8223
Cherry Hill, N] 08002

Contract Renewal is based on a 12 mon
wlil Involce your organization for the

It Is also respectfully raquested that Your district’s personng! do not sollcit, recrult, or hire Brétt DiNov & Assoc
consultants to work directly for the schqol district as sach consultant has signed a non-co pete agreement in thelr
contracts with Brett DiNov! & Asscoclatas.

We lock forward to being consldered to provide heha tes for your school district. Please conflrm
requested service(s), sign below and return to my attention to the following emall address:
chaslty@brettdassociates.com. Your signature on this letter will serve as canfirmation that you agree to provide payment
for these services. Please do not hesitate to call me at {B55) 528-1686 if you have any questions regarding this conlract.

Sincerely,
(e

Chasity Bright
Executive Vice Prasident of Operations
Brett DiNovi & Associatas, LL.C.

Signature of Authorlzed Schoot Adminlstratar Date

Printed Name of Authorized School Adminlstrator

Excellence in Consultation & Training

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1



Children’s Center Outreach Department
Price Structure 2022-2023

total for schoal year)

SERVICE FEE STAFF PROVIDING SERVICE
Speech Therapy $100.00/hr Speech Therapist
Physical Therapy $100.00/hr Physical Therapist
Occupational Therapy 3100.00/hr Occupational Therapist
Occupational Therapy $130.00/hr Occupational Therapist {Sensory Integrated
(sensory inlegrated) Certified) |
Home Instruction $68.00/hr Teacher of the Handicapped
Home Training $68/hr Teacher of the Handicapped
Home Training $58/br Teacher Assistant
*Home Training Assessment $350 Selected Professional Staff
Evalualions:
Speech Therapy $1200 Speech Therapist
Occupational Therapy 3500 Occupationa! Therapist
Physlcal Therapy $ 350 Physical Therapist
Administrative fee (up to 10hrs $25/hr Professional Staff

Workshops

Fee upon request

Professional Staff

2124/22
ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1
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DEL.A_ GROUP Delta-T Group Education Rafes

Educational Rate Sheet 2022-2023

Prepared for

Professional Hourly Rate
ABA Therapist $38.00
ABA Aid $30.00
BCABA/BCBA $110.00
RN $55.00
LPN $45.00
One 1o One Aides/Teacher’s Aide $26 00
Paraprofessionals $28.00
Teachers (Lope Term) _ $40.00
Special Education Teachers 3$50.00
Special Education Teachers (Dual Certifications) $57.00
Home Instructor $42.00
Home Instructor (Dual Certifications) £47.00
Teacher of the Handicapped __$52.00
ESL, Teacher $50.00
Reading Specialjst $60.00
School Psychologist $£70.00
School Social Worker/Counselgrs $47.00
LDTC $£70.00
Job Coach $42.00
Guidance Counse $47.00
Per Evaluation

Psychological Evaluations or Re-Evaluation $450.00
Psychological Evaluatio Re-Evaluation (Bi-Lingual _$525.00
Functiona] Behavioral Assessment $570.00
Functionn) Behavioral Assessment (Bi-Lingual) $620.00
LDTC Evsluations $450.00
LDTC Evaluations (Bi-Linpual) $525.00
IEP Meeting (Flat rate per Mesting) £145.00
Social Evaluations $450.00
Social Evaluations (Bi-Lingual) $525.00
Speech Evaluation $430.00
Speech Evaluation (Bi-Lingual) £525.00
OT Evaluation $450.00
QT Evaluation (Bi-Lingual) $525.00

Please, call for infarmation on any needed positions yowr do not see above.

Signoture of Client Representative

Print Name and Tiile

BEHAVIORAL HEALTHCARE REFERRAL AGENCY

DELTA-T GROUP
www.delta- tgroup.com

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1
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EDU aez =

Board Certified Behavior Analyst $90.00/hour
Behavior Therapist $85.00/hour
Occupational Theraplst $78.00/hour
Speech Language Pathologist $78.00/hour
Physical Therapist $80.00/hour

Sign Language Interpreter $60.00/hour
Social Worker $75.00/hour

EDU Healthcare’s respanse to Toms River Regional School’s RFP for Therapists & Consultant Services |s an all-
inclusive price per hour. This will be a firm-fixed price agreement. The fee will remain firm and will include all
charges that may be incurred in fulfilling the requirements of the contract. All certifications and licenses will be
provided upon award of the contract.

EDU Healthcare

EDU Healthcare — Toms River Reglonal Schools = Therapists & Consultant Services - RFP

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1



Toms River Regiona) Schools
Purchasing Department
1144 Hooper Avenuc, Toms River, NI 08753
(7132) 505-5500 EXT. 500034 H
www Iichools.com ' A

SUBMITTER INFORMATION
CEnETir i gglrivtbas

QUALIFICATIONS SUBMITTED FOR: Check all that apply:
-~
Bcehavioral Consultant Services ﬁ ~ 4 .

Education Consultant Services é’ /{/ %f éfg V4 M};—ﬂ’/

ucation Servic

Qutreach Services
Behavior Therapist

$82,00 QOccupational Therapist
$82.00 Physical Therapist

584.00 Speech Therapist

Sign Language Interpreter i
_$6500 _  Social Worker

Other services to be considéred: Parg
SUBMITTER NAME_ General Healthcare Resources, LLC dba GHR Education
BY Michael Alcott

(PRINTED NAME)
SIGNATURE__ —~ = o T=———  DpATE_ X 2x/2z
STREET ADDRESS 2230 Hickory Road, Suite 240 P. 0. BOX
CITy_Plymouth Meeting STATE_PA ZIP CODE__19462
. Fih

PHONE 800-879-4471] FAX 610-684-4739
E-MALL ADDRESS__contracts@ghresources.com
Rev, 02.07.2022 ig REQUEST FOR QUALIFICATIONS 202212023

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1



LB L G lorition e

Toms River Regional School District Board of Education

1, Gerald Bruno of GMB Learning Consultants, LLC, submit this proposal in order to be employed in
your district as an LDTC. I further commit o provide the necessary duties and responsibilities required by
the Board of Education and fully understand the scope of wark, activity and services as outlined on the
district’s website. As an LDTC for the past twenty years, and in this district at the East Dover Elementary
School for the 2021-2022 school year, I am fully confident in my ability to conduct Educational
Evaluations, submit reports in a timely fashion and be a valuable asset to the Child Study Team given my
expericnce with testing. e

To the best of my knowledge, there are no known confligtaf interest to be disqualified from Woaski
your district and there have never been any judgmengsor lawsuits against me.

A list of professional references, including addgeSses, contact neme, and contact telephones are on file at
the Department of Special Services. -
.
5/ é .-S . / (WL

proposal. I look very much forward to working in your

Hourly rates to be the same as this year.

Please find enclosed all necessary documents.

Thank you for taking the time to review m
district,

Sincerely,

M L-ph.u;w

Gerald Bruno

March 30, 2022
ADDITIONAL REFERENCES
1. Mr. Matthew Gray  Principal East Dover Elementary School

2. Mrs. Dana Weber  Supervisor of Special Education East Dover Elementary School

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1
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% J&BTherapy

P.0. Box 151
Augusta, NJ 07822

Toms River Regional Schools
1144 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08753

As per your request, we are happy to provide you with our rate information for the 2022-23 school year.
Below is a list of our current rates for the indicated services:

Service Rate
Occupational, and/or Speech Therapy $87.00/hour
Physical Therapy $88.00/hour
Educational Support Services (LDTC) $92.00/hour
Psychologist Services $20.00/hour
Evaluations*® $405.00/evaluation
Behavioral Support Services 592.00/hour
as provided by BCBA/Behavioral Supervisor

Behavioral Plans & Functional Behaviar Assessments: $92.00/hour
Behavioral Support Services $92.00/hour

as provided by a Behaviorist
Reading Specialist $80.00/hour
Home Instruction $65.00/hour
Social Work Services $80.00/hour
ABA Paraprofessional Services $35.00/hour
Paraprofessional Services $28.00/hour
Teacher of the Deaf Services $135.00/hour

Below are several benefits of using J&B Therapy’s related services:

Excellent, highly qualified, closely supervised staff

More district control over caseload hours and positions

One point of contact for all administrative needs

Immediate response and collaboration with J&B Therapy's administration

Evaluations as requested by the CST

Out of district and home-based services provided as requested

Significant cost savings - through Increased productivity and no need for paid benefits

If you are in need of additional information, please let us know. We are looking forward to the passibility
of working with the Torns River Regional School district during the 2022-2023 school year.

Respectfully,
7 e VI Kixoms ibere.

John Kriege, OTR and Rebecca Kriege, MA, OTR
Owners, Administrators, Occupational Therapists

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1



Pricing Information

Servicejlypel |

Zﬂ’% L e770) »Za/o—’/’///; Z=

: IniDistricti |8 Out(of;:District E Home Based i Evaluation.s.
Occupational $76.50 $78.50 $80.50 $200.00
Therapy per hour per hour per hour per evaluation
Physical $78.50 $80.50 $82.50 $200.00
Therapy per hour per hour per hour per evaluation
Speech $80.50 $82.50 $84.50 $200.00
Therapy per hour per hour per haur per evaluation

Jump Ahead Pediatrics is proud to offer such competitive rates
Explanation of | that incorporate all the requirements as outlined within the RFP.
Costs: Furthermore, should you have any questions, please do not

hesitate to reach out to us for more information.
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Family of Companics

IIl. Fee Proposal /’:;(/Vﬁ 2%/7?/7%4@ _Q:é&(/ ez

While committing to providing Toms River BOE with significant cost savings, Invo also maintains strong
quality assurances to pravide highly qualified and experienced providers, Qur providers foster strong
relationships within their assigned schools and drive positive student outcomes. Hourly rates are based
on cost of living standards for specific geographic areas and hourly rate market comparisons of similar
school districts within specific geographic areas. Our proposed hourly rates include all of these direct
and indlrect costs:

« Compensation for direct service and administrative support

* National and local marketing and recruiting expenses

= Health and welfare benefits, PTO, workers’ compensation, professional liability insurance
» Housing allowance, relocation expenses, tuition reimbursement {where applicable)

« Professional development including continuing education allowance and on-line CEUs

e State licensure reimbursement

Professional association dues
= On-going recruiting and human resources support
= Payroll and processing costs

Hourly rates are as follows:

Applied Behavior Analyst $45.00
Board Certified Behavioral Analyst $89.00
Occupational Therapist $75.50
Physical Therapist $75,50
Speech Language Pathologist $75.50
! Licensed Clinical Social Worker $63.00

Inve does not have any judgments within the last five (5) years and/or any bankruptcy or organizational
proceedings within the last ten {10) years that will impact our ability to complete the scope of work.

Praposer: Invo Healthcare Associates, LLEC.

Rosnnnca tas Tame Bivar BOE | increnmtianal 0 Boaletad Camdons ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # I



Kaleid@scope

LDUCATION SOLUTIONS

Cost Statement
Per Hour
Monolingual Per Hour Bilingual Flat Rate - Eval, Flat Rate- Eval,
Services Services Maonalingual Bilingual
Speech
Language
Services $90.00 $92.00 $625,00 $650.00
Occupationsal
Therapy
Services $50.00 $92.00 $625.00 $650.00
Physical
Therapy
Services $97.00 $95.00 $675.00 $680.00

Included in Fees:

*  All compensation for the professionals

* Customized reporting and invoicing

= Recruiting, screening, and credentialing process and costs
*  24/7 coverage and availability

*  Assistance with documentation to ensure proper billing

= Billing to the District only for approved hours

= QOvertime, charged at applicable mandated rates

*  Any supplies will be billed at cost

Kaleldoscope Education Solutions 950 East Haverford Road, Suite 1008, Bryn Mwﬁb?ﬁ D ‘.M ATTA C HMENT # ’




BG Therapy Rates 2022-2023

Speech Therapy-$85/hour
Occupational Therapy-$85/hour
Physical Therapy-$80/hour

Speech Therapy Evaluation monolingual-$400
Occupational Therapy Evaluation-$350
Physical Therapy Evaluation-$325

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1



’ Corporate Headquarlers

300 Corporate Center Drive

: Manalapan, N] 07726
Tel (732} 7611955

@ Fax (732) 76 1-8404

(800) 71 8-8855

gg&sc%-r:gg www.axlordconsulting.com

“Your Staffing Source for Educational and Therapeutic Professionals.”

Please accept this as a forma! lelter of proposal for services for the Toms River Regional
School District for the 2022-2023 school year.

NOW also offering TRANSLATION/INTERPRETATION SERVICES and expanded
ABA Services, call for more information!

SERVICES RENDERED AT THE SCHOOL SETTING
SRR So NENDENED AL 10 SCHOOL SETTING

Speech Therapy $ 85.00/hour
Occupational Therapy $ 85.00/hour
Physical Therapy & 85.00/hour
Spccial Education Instruction § 65.00/hour
ABA-Direct Instruction § 65.00/hour
BCBA Supervision $ 95.00/hour
Psychologist/LDTC § 80.00/hour
Social Worker § 65.00/hour

SERVICES RENDERED OUT-OF-DISTRICT OR HOME BASED
sty D LRV UV U DS IRICT OR HOME BASED

Speech Therapy $100.00/session
Occupational Therapy $100.00/session
Physical Therapy $100.00/session
EVALUATIONS

English - Bi-lingual
LDTC Evaluation $450.00- $650.00
Psychological Evaluation $450.00 - $650.00
Social Evaluation $450.00- $650.00
Speech Therapy Evaluation 3450.00 - $650.00
Occupational Therapy Evaluation $450.00 - $650.00
Physical Therapy Evaluation $450.00- $650.00
Functional Behavioral Asscssment $850.00

The evaluations would include a written report, If attendance at an IEP meeting is required,
the rate would be at an additional $95.00/hour plus .0545/mile for travel reimbursement.

New York if q
Stalen Islan(t;:iw'oY %rilddlclmvn nnl-nlsa-i ocr-l}lann..n ADDENDUM A-’TKWEN T#1



##5 PREFERRED

b
§ R
v BEHAVIORAL HEALTH GROUP
An Oaks Integrated Care Affiliate

13. A statement addressing any known potential conflicts of interest that may result in the provider
becoming disqualified fram working for the Toms River Regional Schools Board of Education for
any reason.

There are no known potential conflicts of interest that may result in PBHG becoming disqualified from
working with the Toms River Regional Schools Board of Education for any reason,

14. Information detailing any/all judgments against the submitter and employees, if any
employees, for the last five {5) years; and 2 list of any currently outstanding lawsuits.

There are ent or currently outstanding lawsuits against this submi

. Hourly Rate

The current contracted rate per referral, as stated in the 2021{2022 contract, is $300.00 per
assessment.

S LS S S < o ey S R T drmym = e e e 8 e

ary Pat Angelln CEO
e N O BENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1
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Hourly Rates

Hourly rates are to be submitted at this time for BOE consideration. The BOE will
provide contract document for execution, and/or Purchase Order, as is applicable,
prior to the start of any services. The BOE will consider utilizing provider’s contract.
Please submit for BOE consideration.

Please see below for a table noting our all-inclusive hourly rate for the services requested. This one low
rate covers everything from adminlstrative costs to payroll taxes and unemployment compensation
insurance. Qur goal Is a straightforward program that will align with your budget and never present any
surprises or hidden charges.

Service Offering tHourly Rate
Behavioral Consult Services Counselor - 560-65
Psychologlst - $75-80
Social Worker -569155_
Education Consultant Services 55575
£ducation Services $50-65 _ e,
Qutreach Services A m $55-65 - o
Behavior Therapist BCBA - §75-80
) RBT 549.00
Occupational Therapis_t §70-75
Physical Therapist $75-80
Speech Therapist o 570-75
Sign Language Interpreter 550-60
ProCare Therapy .
5550 Peachtree Patkway
Peacheree Corners, GA 30092 26

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1
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55G typically works with school districts on a per hour basis. The hourly rate is an all-inclusive, and only
applies to the hours that the therapist is working. Time off, holidays, sick time and lunch are not billable
and 55G will not invoice TRRS for these time periods.,

55G is a company owned and operated by special education professionals. Our goal is to provide the best
possible Special Education Services In the most cost-effective way. We understand the budgetary
constraints put on schools, and we do our best to keep our rates as low as possible.

2022-23

Speech Language Pathologist: $80.06/Hour
Occupational Therapist: $80.00/Hour
Physical Therapist: $80.00/Hour
Behaviar Consultant Services: %80.00/Hour
Behavior Therapist: $B0.00/Hour
Educational Consultant Services: $80.00/Hour .
Outreach Services: $80.00/Hour
Board Certified Behavior Analyst (BCBA): $100.00/Hour
Sign Language Interpreter: $78.00/Hour
School Psychologlst: $90.00/Hour
Learning Disability Teacher Consultant: $85.00/Hour
Paraprofessianal: $35.00/Haur
Registered Behavior Technician: 542.00/Hour
Special Education Teacher: $80.00/Hour
DHH/TVI Teachers: $85.00/Hour

u

Please feel free to contact us with any questions regarding this rate information,

28
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[ TOMS RIVER REGIONAL SCHODLS - Rate Sheet 5Y2022.2023 ]

TherapyTravelers speciolizes in providing highly qualified therapists to school districts across
the country. We are o Sauthern Callfornia-based business and enjoy working with districts
natlonwlide,

We focus on staffing the following positions: Speech Language Pathologist, Speech Language
Pathologist Assistant, Speech-Longuoge Pathologist — CFY, Occupational Therapist,
Occupationol Thernplst Assistant, Physicol Therapist, Physical Th erapist Assistant,
Psychologist, and Schoof Nurses.

R T T T
BCBA $88-5110+
RBT $60-570+
Behavior Intervantlonist S60-570+ PR
Occupational Therapist $88-5105
COTA $66-575+
Physical Therapist $88-5105+
PTA $66-576+
Speech-Language Pathologist $90-5110+
SLP-CFY 5§75-890+
SLPA £74-587+
School Psychologist 490-5110+
Social Worker $80-595+
Schanl Counselor 578-588+

AN $66-$88+
N $60-566+
Speclal Education Teacher $72-582+

Our rates include Vision/Medical/Dental Benefits for our contractors, 461K options,
Continuing Educatlon, Mentorship, Travel Stipends, Mileage Relmbursement (for eligible
candidates), and we conduct  criminal background chack and T8 test. Our rates vary depending
upon the scope of the contract, location, duratlen, and avallable therapists,

*Mileage s billed at the current IRS rate

Our mission is to attract, empower and retain the finest therapists so every human can manifest their full potential

ADDENDUM ATTACHMENT # 1
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FEE SCHEDULE
Type of Service Occupational |Physical |Speech LDTC Psych Social
Therapy Sessions $85/hr $85/hr $8s/hr $Bs/hr $8s/hr $Bs5/hr
Out-of-District Services $85/30 min $85/3omin | $85/30 min | $85/30 min | $85/30 min | $85/30 min
Home Care Services $170/hr $170/hr §170/hr — - e
Evaluations In-district* $375 $375 $400 $525 8525 —--
Evaluations Out-of-District | $375 $375 $400 5525 5525 e
Bilingual Evaluations
In-District —— —— $525 5650 $650 e
Bilingual Evaluations
Out-of-District — — 5525 $650 $650 —

Rates are negotiable based on volume of service provided.

*No charge for in-district evaluations that fit within therapist’s working

hours.
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Minimum Requirement Qualifications Submissions

12. Professional References:

Robyn A, Klim, LCSW \
Director of Educational Services

Freehold Township School District

384 West Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

Phone: 732-431-9355 Ext 8827

rklim@frgehgldtwg.lglz.nj.u;

Matthew Kirkpatrick

District Director of Student Support Services
Middletown Township Public Schools

834 Leonardville Road, 2™ FI.

Leonardo, NJ 07737

732-671-3B50 Ext 1021

Kfrkgggrickm@migd!emﬂnklg.org

Nelyda Perez
Assistant Superintendent of Student Services & Programs
Matawan-Aberdeen Regional School District
One Crest Way

Aberdeen, N1 07747

732-705-4023

nperez arsd.or

13. There are no conflicts of interest that would result in YMCA of Greater Monmouth
County being disqualified from working for the Toms Rivdr regional Schools BOE.

14. There are no judgements against YMCA o

!

15, As per the attached MOU, there are no hourly rates for services, rather a $3,500 per
building administrative counseling fee totaling $63,000 which is paid for by a grant

acquired by the district.
I

YMCA COUNSELING & SOCIAL SERVICES,

YMCA OF GREATER MONMOUTH COUNTY. Here for all!

166 Main Street’ 0 1732.290.8040° = - YM.CAIDU'OE..Q R : F:nancialassistance 1s offered
Matawan;N] 07747 infd@ymcainj.org__ : OO@GQG ) P biasec on avaniakility of funds




