TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA - JULY 19, 2023

2023/2024 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

C. AWARD OF BIDS

BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS & SUPPLIES —~ SUPPLEMENTAL

VENDOR

CELEBRITY FORD OF TOMS RIVER (*)
FLEET PRIDE, INC. (*)

HUNTER TRUCK, LLC (%)

JASPER ENGINES & TRANSMISSIONS (*)
NAPA AUTO PARTS/NEPTUNE NAPA (*)
NEOPART TRANSIT LLC (*)

(*} AWARD — DISCOUNTS ON ATTACHMENT #8 TO HOLD FOR THE CONTRACT PERIOD JULY 18, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024.
PURCHASE REQUESTS TO BE SUBMITTED FOR BOARD APPROVAL ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.

BID: BUS-14.1 PURCHASE OF REMANUFACTURED SCHOOL BUS ENGINES

VENDOR: JASPER ENGINES

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

UNIT COST | CORE CHG | NET COST | SHIPPING INCLUDED

ENGINE DESCRIPTION

6.8 FORD/ROUSH PROPANE NO BID
8.8 PSI GASOLINE NO BID
B.8 PSI PROPANE NO BID
8.9 PS| PROPANE NQO BID

2024-2025 SCHOOL YEAR

UNIT COST | CORE CHG | NET COST | SHIPPING INCLUDED

ENGINE DESCRIPTION

6.8 FORD/ROUSH PROPANE NO BID
8.8 PSI GASOLINE NO BID
8.8 PSI PROPANE NO BID

8.9 PSI PROPANE NO BID




TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA - JULY 19, 2023

2023/2024 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

D.  CONTRACT EXTENSIONS
BID: JAN-07 JANITORIAL SERVICE @ TOMS RIVER CORPORATE CENTER @1144 HOOPER AVENUE
CONTRACT EXTENSION #2
CONTRACT PERIOD: AUGUST 1, 2023 THROUGH JULY 31, 2024 (12 MONTHS)
BIDDER MONTHLY TOTAL
ABSOLUTE CLEANING SYSTEMS, LLC 4,300.73 | 51,608.76 | (*)
(*} AWARD
G.  RESOLUTIONS
NUMBERS VENDOR SCOPE
P1254 TD EQUIPMENT FINANCE, INC. TECH-912F CONTRACT AWARD

LEASE FINANCING FOR THE PURCHASE OF
IT EQUIPMENT & ASSOCIATED PRODUCTS/SERVICES

COPIES OF RESOLUTIONS ARE KEPT ON FILE IN THE BOARD SECRETARY'S OFFICE.

AMOUNT

$750,000.00



BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR CELEBRITY FORD OF TOMS RIVER (*)
item % Disc- | % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments
1 |Additives FORD 38.00%| 38.00%|CURRENT MFG. LIST
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 3B.00%
2 |Air Conditioning Components, etc. FORD 38.00%| 3B8.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
3 |Automotive Fasteners FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
4 |Axles FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
S |Air Conditioning & Heating Units FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
6 |Back Up Alarm & Horns {auto) FORD 38.00%| 3B.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%) 38.00%
7 |Belts (fan & generator) auto FORD 38.00%] 38.00%
MQTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
8 |Body & Chassi Parts; Glass, Windshields, etc. FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
9 |Brake Parts FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
10 |Cable & Terminals (Auto) FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
11 |Chassis, Steering, Suspension Parts FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 3B8.00%
12 |Clamps, hose, fittings FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
13 |Ceooling System Parts FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%} 38.00%
14 |Drive Components - Automotive FORD 38.0096] 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
15 |Electrical Accessories FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
16 _|Engine Parts & Rebuild. Components FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
17 |Exhaust System Parts (Auto) FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
18 |Filters (Qil, Fuel, Air, etc.) FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
19 |Fuel System Parts {auto) FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%) 38.00%

Continued on next page

ATTACHMENT #8



BUS-01.1 AUTQ/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL 2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR CELEBRITY FORD OF TOMS RIVER {*)
Item % Disc - | % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments
20 |Gaskets {automotive) FORD 38.00%| 3B.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
21 |Heating/Cooling System components, belts & hoses FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
Hose: heater, radiator, vacuum, brake,wiper, washer, etc.
22 |(auto) FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTQRCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
Ignition system: (auto} condensors, points, rotor, spark
23 |plug wires, etc, FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
24 |Lights & bulbs: {auto, sealed beam, halogen, led, etc. FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
25 |Paint (aute) cans and aergsels FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
26 |Seats {cushions/covers) FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
27 |Switches FORD 38.00%| 3B.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
28 |Specialized auto accessories FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
29 |Transmissions - Std., Auto, & Parts FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
30 |Undercoating & Rust compounds FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTQRCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
31 |Wheel & Axle bearings and seals FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38,00%| 38.00%
32 |Wheels & Rims {auta) FORD 38.00%] 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%] 38.00%
33 |windshield wiper arms/blades FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
34 [Rebuilt parts (all types) FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
35 |Hydraulic Hose/fittings/adapters FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
36 [Shop Supplies FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%| 38.00%
37 |Chemicals FORD 38.00%| 38.00%
MOTORCRAFT 38.00%) 38.00%

ATTACHMENT #8



BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR FLEET PRIDE, INC. {*)
tem % Disc - | % Disc. -

# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions Comments
Percentage OPP is the minimum
discount. Final sale price may be

1 |Additives FPPF CHEMICAL COMPANY 20.00%| 20.00%|CURRENT MG. LIST Jlower.

PARA SERVICE 20.00%| 20.00%
IVANS OIL PRODUCTS 20.00%| 20.00%
RADIATOR SPECIALTIES 20.00%] 20.00%
2 JAir Conditioning Components, etc. AIRSQURCE 20.00%| 20.00%
PRIMATECH 20.00%| 20.00%
OTR 30.00% 30.00%
3 |Automotive Fasteners
4 |Axles OTR/POVE PRODUCTS 20.00%]| 20.00%
DEXTER 20.00%| 20.00%
5 _|Air Conditioning & Heating Units ROBINAIR 15.00%| 15.00%
MASTER COOL 15.00%| 15.00%
6 |Back Up Alarm & Horns {auto) OTR 30.00%| 30.00%
ECCO 20.00%] 20.00%
7 |Belts {fan & generator) auto DAYCO 30.00%| 30.00%
GATES 20.00%| 20.00%
Body & Chassi Parts; Glass, Windshields,
8 |etc. DORMAN PRODUCTS 20.00%| 20.00%
9 |Brake Parts OTR 40.00%| 40.00%
10 |Cable & Terminals (Auto) OTR/ POVE PRODUCTS 30.00%| 30.00%
11 |Chassis, Steering, Suspension Parts OTR/ POVE PRODUCTS 30.00%| 30.00%
MONRQOE 25.00%] 25.00%
GABRIEL 25.00%]| 25.00%
DAYTON PRODUCTS
12 |Clamps, hose, fittings BREEZE 20.00%| 20.00%
GATES 40.00%| 40.00%
OTR 30.00% 30.00%
13 |Cooling System Parts OTR 30.00%| 30.00%
GATES 20.00%| 20.00%
14 |Drive Components - Automotive SPICER 20.00%| 20.00%
OTR/HOV 30.00%| 30.00%
EATON 20.00%| 20.00%
15 |Electrical Accessories DELCO-REMY 20.00%| 20.00%
OTR 30.00%] 30.00%

Continued on next page
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR FLEET PRIDE, INC. (*)
Item % Disc - | % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up { Pricing Structure Exceptions Comments
16 |Engine Parts & Rebuild. Components AMERICAN CYLINDER HOUSE 20.00%} 20.00%
AFA INDUSTRIES 20,00%| 20.00%
OTR 30.00%| 30.00%
17 |Exhaust System Parts (Auto) OTR/POVE PRODUCTS 30.00%| 30.00%
DONALDSON 20.00%]| 20.00%
18 |Filters (Qil, Fuel, Air, etc.) BALDMAN 53.00%| 53.00%
19 |Fuel System Parts (auto)
20 |Gaskets
21 |Heating/Cooling System components GATES 20.00%| 20.00%
OTR 30.00%| 30.00%
22 |Hoses GATES 20.00%| 20.00%
OTR 30.00%| 30.00%
23 |ignition System (auto) parts
24 |Lights/Bulbs (auto} OTR 40.00%) 40.00%
TRUCKLITE 40.00%| 40.00%
GRATE 40.00%| 40.00%
EIKE LIGHTING 40.00%| 40.00%
25 |Paint {auto} cans and aerosols BIG RIG (SEYMOUR) 30.00%| 30.00%
26 |Seats {cushions/covers) DORMAN PRODUCTS 20.00%| 20.00%
BOSTROM SENTRY 20.00%| 20.00%
27 |Switches LITTLE PWE 25.00%] 25.00%
OTR/POVE PRODUCTS 30.00%] 30.00%
28 |Specialized auto accessories DORMAN PRODUCTS 20.00%| 20.00%
29 |[Transmissions - Std., Auto, & Parts TRANS AXLE 30.00%| 30.00%
30 |Undercoating & Rust compounds
31 |Wheel & Axle bearings and seals RV HD 30.00%] 30.00%
NATIONAL SEATING 30.00%| 30.00%
STEMCO 30.00%| 30.00%
TIMKOM 30.00%| 30.00%
NTN 35.00%] 35.00%
32 |Wheels & Rims {auto) OTR/HDV 30.00%] 30.00%
33 |Windshield wiper arms/blades ANTOTEX 20.00%| 20.00%
34 |Rebuilt parts (all types)
35 |Hydraulic Hose/fittings/adapters GATES 40.00%] 40.00%
36 [Shop Supplies OIL-DM 20.00%| 20.00%
KIMBERLY CLARK 20.00%| 20.00%
QTR/POVE PRODUCTS 20.00%| 20.00%
37 |Chemicals CRG 20.00%| 20.00%
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDGR HUNTER TRUCK, LLC {*)
Item % Disc- | % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments
1 [Additives NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%|CURRENT MFG. LIST
2 |Air Conditioning Components, etc. NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
WEITRON REFRIGERANTS 27.50%| 27.50%
3 |Automotive Fasteners NAVISTAR 27.50%) 27.50%
4 |Axles NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
MERITO 27.50%| 27.50%
DANA/SPICER 27.50%| 27.50%
EATON 27.50%| 27.50%
5 |Air Conditioning & Heating Units NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
6 |Back Up Alarm & Horns (auto) NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
ECCO 27.50%| 27.50%
VELVAC 27.50%| 27.50%
7 |Beilts {fan & generator) auto NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
GATES 27.50%| 27.50%
DAYCO 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
Body & Chassi Parts; Glass, Windshields,
8 Jetc. NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
9 |Brake Parts NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
MERITOR 27.50%] 27.50%
PERFORMANCE FRICTION 27.50%| 27.50%
BENDIX 27.50%| 27.50%
HALDEX 27.50%| 27.50%
10 |Cable & Terminals {Auto) NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
MSC
11 |Chassis, Steering, Suspension Parts NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
TRW 27.50%| 27.50%
DANA/SPICER 27.50%| 27.50%
MONROE 27.50%| 27.50%
GABRILE 27.50%| 27.50%
12 |Clamps, hose, fittings NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
PARKER 27.50%] 27.50%
MSC 27.50%| 27.50%

Continued on next page
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR HUNTER TRUCK, LLC {*)
Item % Disc - | % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments
13 |Cooling System Parts NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
SPECTRA 27.50%| 27.50%
CUMMINS 27.50%( 27.50%
CAT 27.50%| 27.50%
14 |Drive Components - Automotive NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
DANA/SPICER 27.50%| 27.50%
EATON 27.50%| 27.50%
MERITOR 27.50%) 27.50%
15 |Electrical Accessories NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
DELCO REMY 27.50%| 27.50%
LEECE NEVILLE 27.50%| 27.50%
MITSUBISHI ELECTRIC 27.50%| 27.50%
16 [Engine Parts & Rebuild. Components NAVISTAR 27.50%] 27.50%
CUMMINS 27.50%| 27.50%
CAT 27.50%| 27.50%
17 |Exhaust System Parts {Auto) NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
CUMMINS 27.50%| 27.50%
CAT 27.50%| 27.50%
18 |Filters {Oil, Fuel, Air, etc.) NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETGUARD 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
19 |Fuel System Parts (auto) NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
CUMMINS 27.50%| 27.50%
CAT 27.50%] 27.50%
20 |Gaskets NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
CUMMINS 27.50%| 27.50%
CAT 27.50%| 27.50%
21 Heating/Cooling System components NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
CUMMINS 27.50%] 27.50%
CAT 27.50%] 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
22 |Hoses NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
CUMMINS 27.50%| 27.50%
CAT 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
23 |lgnition System (auto} parts NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%

Continued on next page

ATTACHMENT #8



BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL 2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR HUNTER TRUCK, LLC (*)
item % Disc - | % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pickup | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments
24 |Lights/Bulbs {auto) NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
GE 27.50%) 27.50%
TRUCK LITE 27.50%| 27.50%
GROTE 27.50%| 27.50%
25 |Paint (auto) cans and aerosols NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
26 |Seats (cushions/covers) NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
BESI 27.50%| 27.50%
NATIONAL SEATS 27.50%| 27.50%
27 |Switches NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
28 |Specialized auto accessories NAVISTAR 27.50%) 27.50%
29 |Transmissions - Std., Auto, & Parts {COMPLETE) ALLSION 27.50%| 27.50%
{PARTS) NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
(PARTS) MERITOR 27.50%{ 27.50%
(PARTS) EATON 27.50%| 27.50%
{PARTS) SPICER 27.50%| 27.50%
30 |Undercoating & Rust compounds NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
MSC 27.50%| 27.50%
31 |Wheel & Axle bearings and seals NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
TIMKIN 27.50%| 27.50%
NATIONAL 27.50%| 27.50%
CR 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
32 |Wheels & Rims {auto) NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
ACCURIDE 27.50%| 27.50%
ALCOA 27.50%| 27.50%
33 |windshield wiper arms/blades NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
ANCO 27.50%| 27.50%
TRICO 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
34 |Rebuilt parts (all types) NAVISTAR 27.50%) 27.50%
CUMMINS 27.50%| 27.50%
CAT 27.50%| 27.50%
35 |Hydraulic Hose/fittings/adapters NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
MSC 27.50%| 27.50%
Continued on next page
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR HUNTER TRUCK, LLC {*}
ltem % Disc - { % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments
36 |Shop Supplies NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
MSC 27.50%) 27.50%
37 |Chemicals NAVISTAR 27.50%| 27.50%
FLEETRITE 27.50%| 27.50%
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL 2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR JASPER ENGINES & TRANSMISSIONS (*)
Item % Disc- | % Disc. -

# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments
Additives CURRENT MFG. LIST

Air Conditioning Components, etc.
Automotive Fasteners

Axles

Air Conditioning & Heating Units
Back Up Alarm & Horns (auto)
Belts (fan & generator auto

Body & Chassi Parts; Glass, Windshields,
etc.

Brake Parts

10 |Cable & Terminals {Auto)

11 |Chassis, Steering, Suspension Parts
12 |Clamps, hose, fittings

13 |Cooling System Parts

14 |Drive Components - Automotive
15 |Electrical Accessories

~jovun | w2

-]

o

16 |Engine Parts & Rebuild. Components CATENGINE, FUEL & AIR 25.00%| 25.00%
CUMMINS 25.00%| 25.00%
INTERNATIONAL 25.00%| 25.00%
FORD, GM 25.00%{ 25.00%
JASPER 25.00%| 25.00%
DODGE 25.00%( 25.00%

17 |Exhaust System Parts (Auto)
18 [Filters {Oil, Fuel, Air, etc.)

19 |Fuel System Parts (auto) CAT 25.00%| 25.00%
CUMMINS 25.00%| 25.00%
INTERNATIONAL 25.00%| 25.00%
FORD, GM 25.00%| 25.00%
JASPER 25.00%| 25.00%
BLUEBIRD 25.00%| 25.00%
DODGE 25.00%| 25.00%

20 [Gaskets

21 [Heating/Cooling System components

22 |Hoses

23 |lgnition System (auto) parts
Continued on next page
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL 2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR JASPER ENGINES & TRANSMISSIONS (*)
Item % Disc- | % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pickup | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments

24 |Lights/Bulbs {auto)
25 |Paint {auto} cans and aerosols
26 [Seats {cushions/covers)

27 |Switches

28 [Specialized auto accessories

29 |Transmissions - Std., Auto, & Parts ALLSION 25.00%| 25.00%
FORD, GM 25.00%| 25.00%
INTERNATIONAL 25.00%| 25.00%
JASPER 25.00%| 25.00%
SPICER 25.00%] 25.00%

30 |Undercoating & Rust compounds

31 |Wheel & Axle bearings and seals

32 |Wheels & Rims {auto}

33 |Windshield wiper arms/blades

34 {Rebuilt parts (all types) CAT 25.00%| 25.00%
CUMMINS 25.00%| 25.00%
INTERNATIONAL 25.00%| 25.00%
JASPER, FORD 25.00%| 25.00%
GM, DODGE 25.00%| 25.00%
DANA 25.00%| 25.00%

35 |Hydraulic Hose/fittings/adapters

36 |Shop Supplies
37 |Chemicals
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL 2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR NAPA AUTO PARTS/NEPTUNE NAPA (*}
Item % Disc - | % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments
1 lAdditives NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%|CURRENT MFG. LIST
MACS 60.00%| 60.00%
PERMATEX 60.00%| 60.00%
LOCTITE 60.00%| 60.00%
2 _JAir Conditioning Components, etc. NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
4 SEASONS 60.00%| 60.00%
3 |Automotive Fasteners ROCKFORD 45.00%| 45.00%
4 |Axles REDNECK 50.00%| 50.00%
UNITED 50.00%| 50.00%
5 _|Air Conditioning & Heating Units NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
4 SEASONS 60.00%| 60.00%
6 |Back Up Alarm & Horns (auto) BALKAMP 60.00%| 60.00%
7 {Belts {fan & generator) auto NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
GATES 60.00%| 60.00%
8 |Rody & Chassi Parts; Glass, Windshields, etc. NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
CAP 60.00%| 60.00%
9 |Brake Parts UNITED 60.00%| 60.00%
NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
10 |Cable & Terminals (Auto) NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
BELDEN 60.00%| 60.00%
11 |[Chassis, Steering, Suspension Parts NAPA 60.00%] 60.00%
MOOG 60.00%| 60.00%
12 |Clamps, hose, fittings NAPA 65.00%| 65.00%
BALKAMP 65.00%| 65.00%
13 |Cooling System Parts NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
GATES 60.00%| 60.00%
SPECTRA 60.00%| 60.00%
14 |Drive Components - Automaotive SKF 65.00%| 65.00%
NAPA £65.00%| 65.00%
LUK 65.00%| 65.00%
15 |Electrical Accessories NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
RAYLOK 60.00%| 60.00%
BEB 60.00%| 60.00%
WISLON 60.00%) 60.00%
16 |Engine Parts & Rebuild. Components NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
SEALED POWER 60.00%| 60.00%
Continued on next page
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR NAPA AUTO PARTS/NEPTUNE NAPA (*)
Item % Disc - | % Disc. -
i Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments
17 |Exhaust System Parts {Auto) NAPA 65.00%| 65.00%
WALKER 65.00%| 65.00%
18 |Filters {Qil, Fuel, Air, etc.) WIX 70.00%} 70.00%
19 |Fuel System Parts (auto} NAPA 65.00%| 65.00%
CARTER 65.00%| 65.00%
20 [Gaskets FELPRO 60.00%| 60.00%
21 Heating]Cooling System components NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
GATES 60.00%| 60.00%
22 |Hoses GATES 60.00%| 60.00%
23 [lgnition System (auto) parts STANDARD 60.00%| 60.00%
ECHLIN 60.00%| 60.00%
24 |Lights/Bulbs {auto) NAPA 65.00%| 65.00%
OLD WORLD IND. 65.00%| 65.00%
25 |Paint (auto) cans and aerosols MARTAIN SENYOR 60.00%| 60.00%
26 |Seats (cushions/covers) NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
BALKAMP 60.00%| 60.00%
27 {Switches NAPA 65.00%| 65.00%
ECHLIN 65.00%| 65.00%
BELDEN 65.00%| 65.00%
28 |Specialized auto accessories GROTE 65.00%| 65.00%
BALKAMP 65.00%| 65.00%
TRUCKLITE 65.00%| 65.00%
29 |Transmissions - 5td., Auto, & Parts NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
ATP 60.00%| 60.00%
30 |Undercoating & Rust compounds MACS 60.00%| 60.00%
3M 60.00%| 60.00%
31 |Wheel & Axle bearings and seals SKF 60.00%| 60.00%
CR 60.00%| 60.00%
TIMKEN 60.00%| 60.00%
NATIONAL 60.00%| 60.00%
32 |Wheels & Rims (auto) CAP 60.00%| 60.00%
33 |Windshield wiper arms/blades TRICO 65.00%| 65.00%
RAIN EX 65.00%]| 65.00%
NAPA 65.00%| 65.00%
34 [Rebuilt parts {all types) MISC. 60.00%| 60.00%
35 |Hydraulic Hose/fittings/adapters WEATHERHEAD 65.00%| 65.00%
GATES 65.00%| 65.00%
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR NAPA AUTO PARTS/NEPTUNE NAPA (*)
Item % Disc - | % Disc. -

# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up Pricing Structure Exceptions | Comments

36 |Shop Supplies BALKAMP 65.00%) 65.00%

37 |Chemicals MACS 60.00%| 60.00%
NAPA 60.00%| 60.00%
CRC 60.00%| 60.00%
PERMATEX 60.00%| 60.00%
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR NEOPART TRANSIT LLC {*}
Item % Disc - | % Disc. -
# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions Comments
Price lists provided for 13 manufacturers,
Other suppliers do not have public published
price lists. Percent discounts will be granted,
but prices are available on an item by item
1 |Additives NEW PIG 10.00%]| 10.00%|CURRENT MG. LIST basis.
2 |Air Conditioning Components, etc. THERMO KING 25.00%| 25.00%
3 |JAutomotive Fasteners
4 |Axles BENDIX 45.00%| 45.00%
HALDEX 40.00%| 40.00%
MERITOR 50.00%| 50.00%
MGM BRAKE 50.00%| 50.00%
5 |Air Conditioning & Heating Units
6 |Back Up Alarm & Horns (auto) FIAMM 10.00%| 10.00%
7 |Belts (fan & generator} auto GATES 10,00%| 10.00%
GOODYEAR 10.00%| 10.00%
DAYCO 10.00%| 10.00%
Body & Chassi Parts; Glass, Windshields,
8 |ete.
9 |Brake Parts BENDIX 45.00%| 45.00%
HALDEX 40.00%| 40.00%
MERITOR/ROCKWELL 50.00%| 50.00%
MGM BRAKE 50.00%| 50.00%
10 |Cable & Terminals {(Auto}
11 {Chassis, Steering, Suspension Parts SUSPA 10.00%| 10.00%
FIRE STONE 25.00%) 25.00%
MERITOR/ROCKWELL 50.00%| 50.00%
GABRIEL 10.00%] 10.00%
WABCO-ZF 25.00%| 25.00%
12 [Clamps, hose, fittings BREEZE 15.00%] 15.00%
13 |Cooling System Parts
14 |Drive Components - Automotive MERITOR/ROCKWELL 50.00%| 50.00%

15 |Electrical Accessories

Continued on next page
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BUS-01.1 AUTO/SCHOOL BUS/TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES - SUPPLEMENTAL

2023-2024 SCHOOL YEAR

VENDOR NEOPART TRANSIT LLC (*}
Item % Disc - | % Disc. -

# Description BRANDS OFFERED delivered | Pick up | Pricing Structure Exceptions Comments

16 |Engine Parts & Rebuild. Components CUMMING 10.00%] 10.00%

17 |JExhaust System Parts {Auto)

18 |Filters {Oil, Fuel, Air, etc.} DONALDSON 25.00%| 25.00%
CUMMING/FLEETGUARD 10.00% 10.00%

19 }Fuel System Parts (auto)

20 [Gaskets CUMMING 10.00%| 10.00%

21 |Heating/Cooling System components

22 |Hoses

23 |lgnition System {auto) parts

24 |Lights/Bulbs {auto) TRUCK-LITE 58.00%| 58.00%
DIALIGHT 25.00%| 25.00%

25 |Paint {auto) cans and aerosols

26 |[Seats (cushions/covers)

27 [Switches

28 |Specialized auto accessories

29 [Transmissions - Std., Auto, & Parts DETROIT DIESEL ALLSION 10.00%| 10.00%

30 [Undercoating & Rust compounds

31 [Wheel & Axle bearings and seals NTN BOWER 25.00%| 25.00%
STEMCO 40.00%] 40.00%

32 [Wheels & Rims {auto) ALCOA 5.00% 5.00%

33 |Windshield wiper arms/blades SPRAGUE 25.00%] 25.00%
ANCO 10.00%| 10.00%

34 |Rebuilt parts (all types)

35 |Hydraulic Hose/fittings/adapters

36 |Shop Supplies

37 |Chemicals

{*) AWARD - DISCOUNTS TO HOLD FOR THE CONTRACT PERIOD JULY 19, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024.
PURCHASE REQUESTS TO BE SUBMITTED FOR BOARD APPROVAL ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.
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