TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA — MAY 21, 2025

2025/2026 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

C. AWARD OF BIDS (PENDING FORMAL APPROVAL FOR 2025/2026 SY BUDGET)

BID: BUS-05 VEHICLE BATTERY REQUIREMENTS

VENDOR: PARTS AUTHORITY LLC (1)
ITEM # EST. QTY SIZE UNIT PRICE $ LESS 1:1 NET PRICE
TRADE $

1 12 GROUP: 26R $74.07 $0.00 $74.07
2 12 GROUP: 24 $79.68 $0.00 $79.68
3 12 GROUP: 24F $79.68 $0.00 $79.68
4 12 GROUP: 34/78 $104.29 $0.00 $104.29
5 6 GROUP: 27 $91.31 $0.00 $91.31
6 6 GROUP: 27F $91.31 $0.00 $91.31
7 36 GROUP: 50 $140.94 $0.00 $140.94
8 36 GROUP: 65 $98.33 $0.00 $98.33
9 12 GROUP: 58 $73.68 $0.00 $73.68
10 4 GROUP: 48 $99.32 $0.00 $99.32
11 6 GROUP: 31 POST $89.77 $0.00 $89.77
12 6 GROUP: 31 3/8 - 16 STUD $89.77 $0.00 $89.77
13 64 GROUP 4D $151.83 $0.00 $151.83
14 2 GROUP: 4DLT $138.12 $0.00 $138.12
15 24 GC2 $131.29 $0.00 $131.29
16 6 U1L $34.83 $0.00 $34.83
17 24 GROUP: 78 $82.91 $0.00 $82.91
18 12 GROUP: GC8 $136.40 $0.00 $136.40
TOTAL UNIT PRICE $1,787.53
COMMENT: BATTERIES ARE SOLD EXCHANGE, PRICE INCLUDES THE RETURN OF THE CORE
DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER'S LIST: 68% OFF PARTS AUTHORITY LIST PRICE

(1) REJECT BID AS NON-RESPONSIVE -DEFICIENT NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED WITH BID.
WILL RE-ADVERTISE FOR BIDS, BUS-05A. RECEIPT DATE: JUNE 18, 2025



TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA - MAY 21, 2025

C.

2025/2026 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

AWARD OF BIDS (PENDING FORMAL APPROVAL FOR 2025/2026 SY BUDGET) (CONTINUED)

BID: BUS-14 PURCHASE OF REMANUFACTURED SCHOOL BUS ENGINES

VENDOR: JASPER ENGINES (1)

2025-2026 SCHOOL YEAR

UNIT COST CORE CHG NET COST SHIPPING INCLUDED

ENGINE DESCRIPTION
3126 CATEPILLAR $16,057.00 $2,500.00 $16,057.00 YES
5.4 FORD GASOLINE $3.,911.00 $500.00 $3.911.00 YES
C7 CATEPILLAR DIESEL $17,374.00 $3,500.00 $17.374.00 YES
6.6 TURBOCHARGED G.M. DIESEL $14,706.00 $3,000.00 $14.706.00 YES
6.0 G.M. GASOLINE $4,601.00 $2,000.00 $4,601.00 YES
ISB 6.7 CUMMINS DIESEL $17,689.00 $4.000.00 $17.,689.00 YES
6.8 FORD GASOLINE $5,040.00 $1,500.00 $5,040.00 YES
6.8 FORD/ROUSH PROPANE NO BID
8.8 PSI GASOLINE NO BID
8.8 PSI PROPANE NO BID
8.9 PSI PROPANE NO BID

$79,378.00
2026-2027 SCHOOL YEAR

UNIT COST CORE CHG NET COST SHIPPING INCLUDED

ENGINE DESCRIPTION
3126 CATEPILLAR $16,057.00 $2,500.00 $16.,057.00 YES
5.4 FORD GASOLINE $3,911.00 $500.00 $3,911.00 YES
C7 CATEPILLAR DIESEL $17.374.00 $3.500.00 $17.374.00 YES
6.6 TURBOCHARGED G.M. DIESEL $14,706.00 $3.000.00 $14,706.00 YES
6.0 G.M. GASOLINE $4.601.00 $2,000.00 $4.601.00 YES
ISB 6.7 CUMMINS DIESEL $17.689.00 $4.000.00 $17,689.00 YES
6.8 FORD GASOLINE $5,040.00 $1,500.00 $5,040.00 YES
6.8 FORD/ROUSH PROPANE NO BID
8.8 PSI GASOLINE NO BID
8.8 PSI PROPANE NO BID
8.9 PSI PROPANE NO BID

$79,378.00

2-YEAR TOTAL $158,756.00

(1) REJECT BID AS NON-RESPONSIVE - ORIGINAL SIGNED LEGAL DOCUMENTS NOT SUBMITTED WITH BID.
WILL RE-ADVERTISE FOR BIDS, BUS-14A. RECEIPT DATE: JUNE 18, 2025




TOMS RIVER BOARD OF EDUCATION
PURCHASING AGENDA — MAY 21, 2025

2025/2026 SCHOOL YEAR — ADDENDUM #1

C. AWARD OF BIDS (PENDING FORMAL APPROVAL FOR 2025/2026 SY BUDGET) (CONTINUED)

BID: CAFE-12 SNACK REQUIREMENTS

NO BIDS RECEIVED.
WILL RE-ADVERTISE FOR BIDS (CAFE-12A). RECEIPT DATE TO BE DETERMINED.

F. PERMISSION TO ADVERTISE (PENDING FORMAL APPROVAL FOR 2025/2026 SY BUDGET)

REQUEST PERMISSION TO ADVERTISE FOR THE FOLLOWING BIDS. RECEIPT DATE: JUNE 18, 2025

A. BUS-05A VEHICLE BATTERY REQUIREMENTS
B. BUS-14A PURCHASE OF REMANUFACTURED BUS ENGINES

REQUEST PERMISSION TO ADVERTISE FOR THE FOLLOWING BIDS. RECEIPT DATE TO BE DETERMINED.

A. CAFE-12A SNACK REQUIREMENTS



